
 
 

Town & Country’s New Hire Is Lifelong East 
Hampton Resident - Reid Offers Real Insight 
Rick Murphy | October 22, 2019 
 
If you want real insight into the community you are 
moving into, take this advice: talk to the locals who 
were raised there. 
 
Town & Country Real Estate’s latest catch, Michael 
Reid, a lifelong resident of East Hampton, is a perfect 
example. 
 
Reid lives in East Hampton Village with his wife, Laura, 
and their two sons. He is deeply rooted in his 
community, volunteering with the East Hampton Fire 
Department and is currently the Lieutenant of Engine 
Company #2. 
 
He works as a public safety dispatcher in Southampton 
Village. In his free time, Michael enjoys kayaking and 
fishing. 
Read between the lines: he knows the special 
hideaways where locals find serenity. 
 
Reid is “extremely passionate about my work in real 
estate and I work hard for my clients and customers 
until the deal is closed.” 
 
He came into real estate after working with drone 
photography for business across the East End. “I made 
the move into the real estate business after seeing the 
increased use of drone photos and especially the use of 
video tours,” he said. 
 
“I feel that I have an advantage by using video tours and social media to market the client’s property. I enjoy seeing a 
client’s satisfaction when they see their property being showcased,” he added. 

https://indyeastend.com/author/zweiss/

